
 

December 31, 2017 

Dear Beloved Friends and Intercessors for Ireland, 

 

It is hard to believe another year has gone by and we are about to launch into a new year, 2018! Time is surely 

accelerating before our very eyes! I have much to share in our ministry year-end update, please forgive the length! 

 

As we begin 2018, I want to give all the praise, glory and honor to our Faithful Bridegroom King Yeshua, and our 

loving, gracious heavenly Father, for all that has been accomplished in and through this ministry and the precious 

brothers and sisters who have labored with us in 2017!  

 

In 2017 by the Lord’s grace alone we were able to accomplish the following: 

 

1. TVOMB held seven monthly meetings, beginning March 25 and ending on September 20 th, with Feast of 

Trumpets. It was a very intense, eight months of laboring in prayer and laying a foundation for the Bride of Ireland 

to walk upon.  

 

2. In our sixth meeting, we did identification repentance on a national level for the blood on our hands as a 

Nation, for the atrocities committed from the mid-1800’s – 1970s, in the Reformatory and Industrial Schools, “So 

Called” Orphanages, County Homes, Magdalene Laundries, and Mom and Baby Homes. The Lord had shown me 

in 2013 that He equated this period of time and abuse as a “holocaust” that we, the Irish had committed against 

the most precious gift a country can have, our children! It is a very painful, sensitive wound in our land that has 

affected just about every family, one way or another. Whether one is a Survivor, or a relation to one, or one who 

partook in these evil crimes. Now was the time to do the work! It was painful to deal openly with the hard facts. 

Many came to labor with us to confess our sins before the Lord – forever thank you, we could not have done this 

work without each of you! Identification repentances is the only way that a nation’s past sins can be atoned for. It 

was the first step for lasting healing to come to our families on a foundational level. So many precious souls here 

have been carrying so much shame, so much fear never saying a word to anyone. And because of it healing could 

not come on the level the Lord wants to heal. But that is now changing, we are seeing fruit.  

 

3. On December 16, 2017, the Tuam Survivors Home Network website was launched. This network provides 

support and a safe space for Survivors to talk about their past. PTL, healing can finally begin to come in a much 

greater measure for our families. This healing is vital for the true church is to arise. 

http://www.tuamhomesurvivors.com/. Thank you Yeshua, Faithful Eternal High Priest! 

 

4. For our seventh meeting – Feast of Trumpets, we hosted a guest speaker, Jill Shannon, a Messianic Jew from 

Israel. Jill’s message was a powerful word for our Nation. A right word spoken in the right season. The ministry 

hosted a feast for those who came to this special meeting, as a gift from our Beloved Bridegroom King to His Bride. 

He wanted to dine and sup with His Bride and lavish His extravagant love upon her. It was a wonderful time of 

fellowship, where the brethren dined and supped in unity together! You can listen to the message on our ministry 

website teaching page: http://thevoiceofmybeloved.com/teachings-2/, or on the ministry YouTube 

Channel: https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCyB5yw-077kwxtEyJlM2VAw. 

 

5. Additionally, the Bride of Ireland was birthed in this meeting. This is a burden the Lord had given me, and I had 

been carrying it for two years. All that I can say is it was a very difficult pregnancy, and the labor pains were 

unbearable at times, and the enemy came more than once trying to “abort” the baby before it was born. But our 
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God is greater and One Who will not spare any expense for His bride, not only to ensure she comes forth, but that 

she now grows and matures – into bridal love! That is the call that is upon her life! 

 

6. During these months, we held three intercessory prayer watches each week, lasting 4-4 ½ hours each. During 

these times of prayer, we have been faithfully calling the true church to repentance, for the true church to arise, for 

the intercessors and laborers to come forth, for the persecuted church in all nations, healing to come to our 

families, for our government, for the unholy chains to the EU to be broken, and for Israel. We are seeing progress! 

 

7. We continue to keep two-prayer watches a week and will increase as the Lord directs. 

 

8. There has been an increasing awakening taking place in our Nation. The true church is awakening, and we are 

seeing more hearts hungering for God and for His holy presence, wanting to come out of Babylon.  

 

9. We have seen an increase in the number of people who have wanted to keep prayer watches. Intercessors for 

Ireland we will be in touch soon!  

 

10. We have been seeing shakings in our government, exposing the corruption. New elections were almost going to 

be necessary this month due to a scandal that broke light into the Minister for Justice, Frances Fitzgerald who was 

found colluding with the Garda to silence whistle blower Maurice McCabe.  

 

11. We saw a major victory earlier this month when SIPO (Standards in Public Office) not only investigated 

Amnesty Ireland, a NGO, for accepting foreign donations from George Soros’s Open Society Foundation, but 

demanding they return the 137,000 euro they received to promote their pro-choice agenda, calling for the 8th 

Amendment to be repealed. Amnesty Ireland is fighting it of course, and requires our faithful and fervent prayer. 

 

What we are seeing is because of strategic prayer. Prayer is what moves the Lord, Who sits above the circle of 
the earth, to bring redemption and restoration. That is the heart of the Father – He longs to restore us. But due to 
so much sin and wounds in us personally, in our government and in our land, before He heal us, it first is painful, 
and often ugly. Just like an abscess – it has to be pierced so the poisons and pus can come out, before it can heal. 
Praise the Lord, God is doing a good work and we forever bow our hearts and knees in awe of His mercy! 
 
2018 is proving that prayer is needed more than ever, and I will now focus on areas of graven concern!  
 
Taoiseach Leo Varadkar and our government, at large, are forcing their LGBT, pro-choice, EU agenda on 
us. Our youth are becoming more confused than ever, if that is possible! We are seeing more and more how our 
politicians are openly embracing, with no shame, their homosexual lifestyles, for the world to see. Last week, 
Fine Gael's Senator Jerry Buttimer married his partner: http://www.thejournal.ie/jerry-buttimer-married-
cork-3773467-Dec2017/. We love our shame more than we love His glory (Hosea 4:18 Amp).  
 
We need to pray for our leaders that their hearts will change, but if they will not change, we need to ask the Lord 
to raise up righteous men and women who will rule our Nation with righteousness and justice, and not let this 
Nation be led to hell. We need a “Donald Trump” raised up in this Nation, that will go against the elite/globalist 
establishment, against all odds, and turn this Nation around! For some this may be hard to hear but it is the 
truth. 
 

President Trump is God’s chosen and anointed one. He is not perfect, and like all of us needs refinement. But we 

need to understand he carries a “Cyrus mantle.” If you are not familiar who Cyrus was, you can read about him in 

Isaiah 45, and a few chapters prior. Basically, God chose a heathen man to restore righteousness. President 

Trump is saved! He is a baby Christian and he needs our prayers more than ever to do what the Lord is asking of 

him! Trump is one who cannot be bought, nor owned by the elite/illuminati. He will not go along with their 
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schemes of evil trying to bring in the NWO to the nations. It is why the onslaught against him is non-stop, doing 

anything they can to discredit him. Some have a hard time with him, many in the church do, but we need to 

remember, the Lord’s ways are not our ways, nor His thoughts ours. He is using this man mightily to save a 

mammoth sinking ship and turn it 180 degrees in the right direction. I caution us to not believe everything we 

read or hear from the liberal media. They are owned by the elite/globalists and they have a real agenda called 

“disinformation” to promote Satan’s agenda – NWO. There are several media sources where we as believers can 

read or hear the truth. We should be seeking those out before we come to any conclusions about situations. And 

then PRAY, PRAY like our lives depend upon it, because they do! 

 

We need to keep praying for Ireland to come out of the EU – that the “Irexit” will happen! The EU was never 

God’s plan for any nation to be enslaved too. It is an anti-Christ system designed to destroy nations by causing them to 

lose their sovereign identity in the Lord Yeshua, as a people, tribe and tongue. By being a member we are aligning 

ourselves with the elite, illuminati and globalists humanistic agenda to bring in the New World Order. Ireland must 

come out of the EU if she is to be a sheep nation and be saved. Excellent video to watch to help educate yourselves if 

you are not aware of the elite/globalist, is David Hathaway: The Rape of Europe: 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=66uCnNwLJtM&feature=youtu.be. This requires our faithful and fervent 

prayer calling for the “Irexit” and these unholy alliances to be broken off our Nation. 

 

The elite/globalists are promoting ISIS/Islam through the EU, and particularly through George Soros.  They 

have an evil agenda to destroy Europe – all nations actually. We see it unfolding before our eyes. We do not hate the 

people who are deceived and follow the doctrine of demon known as Islam, but vehemently oppose the spirit of Islam 

that wants to destroy every one. That Ireland would say “NO” to Islam and want our sovereignty back with closed 

borders. This requires our faithful and fervent prayers that Ireland would wake up to the evil that is assaulting our 

land and our neighbors France, Sweden, Germany, with the violence of Islam. George Soros is the main source behind 

the migrants flooding Europe. The EU made a deal with Turkey recently, 75 million Turks that will now have visa free 

travel to Europe by next year, and we (the EU) are paying Turkey 600,000 billion euro for the exchange! 

 

George Soros is not our friend. We need to pray for our Nation to reject his humanistic agendas and keep rejecting his 

money that is pouring into our land funding: the repeal of the 8th amendment/pro-choice, asylum for migrants, EU 

Army, anti-Israel BDS programs to name a few. PTL for the stand Hungary is taking and wanting nothing to do with 

this man that has one agenda to destroy God’s plans for the nations. We must pray faithfully and fervently against this 

evil that is not only on our doorstep, but has flooded every walk of life in our Nation. 

 

Equally, we have graven concerns within the Body. Church beware of the false unity movement to unite religions. It 

has been gaining rapid momentum the past two years and is now on a fast track. This is not of the Lord. Pope Francis is 

heading this movement, and just as George Soros is not our friend, neither is the Pope. We need to pray for the 

charismatic leaders that have already been swept away in this deception that they will come out of it and not unite 

with the Roman Catholic Church. But we must also pray that the true church wakes up and arises in this hour like 

never before to confront this evil. We will worship Him in Spirit and in Truth. The Pope is scheduled to visit Ireland in 

August 2018 for a World Family Meeting. This requires our faithful and fervent prayer. His coming here is not for our 

good! These videos will help you understand the seriousness of this visit and the affront it is to the true church, and 

just how dark and late the hour is: https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=4cMa1xCQDQM&feature=share, 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=898gHT65OHo&sns=em, 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=kC7BWek-XKE 

 

We all want revival right? Well if you are a Holy Spirit filled believer you do! Two things to say, one, before we see 

revival come, we have to see the Spirit of Repentance – the Spirit of Burning, move upon His people, His true church 

crying out corporately for the forgiveness of our sins (2 Chronicles 7:14). We have not seen that yet on a corporate 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=66uCnNwLJtM&feature=youtu.be
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=4cMa1xCQDQM&feature=share
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=898gHT65OHo&sns=em
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=kC7BWek-XKE


 

level. Instead, at large today we have the hyper-grace, friendly seeker, and prosperity messages in the pulpit that want 

to tell us all is well and make our flesh feel good (2 Peter 2:1-3). These messages are all about “me and I.” They are  

selfish based – how can God bless me and give me what I want, instead of teaching us how to be transformed until Christ 

is completely formed within us, so His will can be done on this earth in our lives (Galatians 2:20, 4:19, Matthew 16:24).  

 

When we start to see true godly sorrow over the state of affairs in the church on a corporate level, then we know the 

Spirit of Revival can come. And that will cause reformation to begin to take place. Reformation is what changes the 

infrastructure on a foundational level. Meaning reformation uproots the false foundations so the t rue foundation can 

be laid. It’s a messy, painful, hard work, but reformation brings lasting change on a governmental level.  

 

Second, we are going to see a “false revival” breakout before we see the real thing. For the very reasons I 

mentioned above, the church is not where she needs to be with repentance. Therefore unless we humble ourselves, 

pray, seek His face and turn from our wicked ways, most will be deceived when the false revival breaks out and be 

swept away by it. In February 2016, the Lord allowed me to see what this false revival will look like. It was terrifying to 

see the masses “jump” in that polluted, vile dirt brown river that was full of every filthy thing imaginable – feces, 

broken rusted pipes, garbage of every kind. But because those who were not willing to be purified by the Refiner’s fire, 

they could not see the filth, debris and how utterly unsafe that river was to swim in. Instead they thought it was the 

most refreshing, clear, clean, fast moving river and could not understand why anyone would not want to jump in it. 

Church beware of deception. To the degree we are willing to let our soul be cleansed, purified by dying to self, is to the 

degree we will be able to discern the deception that is here and getting much worst.  

 

Additionally, in 2012, the Lord had given me a very vivid dream in how He saw His church and how filthy she was. I 

won’t take the time now to share that dream – at some point I will. But it has never left me, and I can assure us all the 

Lord is very grieved with how filthy His people have become and is waiting for us to want to come out of Babylon.  

This requires our faithful and fervent prayers for first the church to want to come out of Babylon, out of all 

compromise and mixture, so that the masses won’t get swept away in this false river of revival, and two that we will 

see revival come to our Nation – it must come, surely it will come, if we will pray, fervently pray!!! 

 

The Lord is looking to His church – His Ecclesia to govern our affairs on earth as in heaven. He is not only looking for us 

to do so – He expects us to do so! He never promised us it would be easy, but promised He would provide everything 

we need to do it His way, if we are willing.  

 

In early November, I started asking the Lord, “What does beauty for ashes look like to You Lord?” I would ponder 

this on and off and say, “I am just wondering Lord, because Your ways are not ours, so what does beauty for ashes look 

like to You, I know You would not put it in Your Word to have no eternal purpose, what does beauty for ashes look like 

to You? It is a verse I have known from the beginning of my walk. At around the same time, the Lord started pulling 

me aside and by mid-November, became clear I was to set the rest of the year aside and do nothing but to wait at 

His feet. So, after about three weeks, of asking my question, I happened to be in Isaiah, reading that verse again. 

This time I stopped after I read it and imagined in my mind what a pile of ashes looked like. As I beheld that image, 

I asked, “Lord how do you take something that has been completely destroyed and make it beautiful again?” He 

quickly replied and said, “That is what I am doing with you Tracy?” I was dumbfounded, but also encouraged!  

 

If any of you are going through the fire, severe testings, and are sincerely doing all that you know how to obey 
the Lord, be of good cheer, know the Lord is in it and faithfully has His majestic hand in wanting to bring you to a 
place of total death, so that the plans He has for you can come forth in the fullest measure. There are many layers 
to dying a believer faces – we get to decide how much. Those circumstances look different for each of us, but the 
Master is after the same result in all of us – total death to self, if we are willing! From the very beginning of my 
walk I was thrown into the fire of affliction, and I mean excruciating and painful! Since then, I have been through 
many fiery trials. And one that will never compare to all the others is when my husband and dad died within 



 

2 ½ months of each other. It was the most difficult time of my life, and because of it when the Lord allows me to 
go through a fiery trial I didn’t see them that way when having to walk through them, not because they weren’t 
painful, but only because nothing would ever compare to the fiery trial of my husband and dad’s deaths.  
 

But what He has allowed me to experience these past 10 months has been a death like no other in every way 

possible. Everyday for weeks on end, I have been bringing Him my pile of ashes and laying them all at His feet – not 

seeing how anything could ever be restored short of a resurrection, including myself! At the time I did not know 

that is exactly what He had hoped I would do, and not try to find a solution, or save myself, but let His fire burn me 

to chars and then hand Him my pile of ashes. For the season we have entered, we cannot take any of “self” with us – 

if we do, it will disqualify us and stop us from becoming all that He had created us to be. If this is you – feeling like 

you are being burned in the fire on every side, may I encourage you let the Master have His way, be willing to let 

Him give you beauty for ashes, but if you don’t have any ashes to give Him, how can our Great King make the 

exchange for you? 

 

This morning while waiting on the Lord here is the word I heard, “2018 will be a roller-coaster ride for those willing 

to follow Me wherever I may lead. Keep securely fastened to Me and at the same time be willing to quickly let go of 

anyone or things that would hinder the plans I have for you. It’s a year of expectations being fulfilled for those who 

wait, hope and expect the Lord (Psalm 27:14). It is a year of transition into the next level. It is a year of out with the old 

ways of doing things and in with the new. It is a year where those who have not been willing to receive My correction 

will miss the opportunity to serve Me in the way I had planned for them. It is a year of great shaking, great awakening 

– so that equipping and bridal preparation can take place in the hearts that had a ‘yes’, but never knew there was a 

Wedding to attend.” 

 

Prayer is our only hope – it is our only answer for the dark and last days we are in. Will you join us in laboring for our 

Nation to be saved, until every captive that can be set free is freed? We need a few good men and women to enlist in 

the Lord’s end-times army.  

 

Please keep us in prayer, for our protection, for finances to come forth to do this work, for the laborers to keep 

coming forth that the golden altar of incense can be re-built – that the Bride of Ireland can present to the Lamb this 

Nation as her wedding gift, on her Wedding Day. That the Lamb will receive the reward of His suffering in the 

fullest measure, this Nation as His rightful inheritance as He deserves (Psalm 2:8). 

 

In His loving mercy, 

 
Tracy Hogan 


